Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2021

CHOG NIV
KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWomeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW®IQ1H2IW] (aIM]EDOA SO0

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

® 1) UMD L) o, 2021 @RV 25
NLWd 25th August 2021
m\ielU;m ¢ 1197 2/levB0 9 m“,\’fc? 2480
ol. Thiruvananthapuram, Sth Chingam 1197
Wednesday 1943 @3B0 3
3rd Bhadra 1943
GH 03 MVAINIDB
oo (Moo dldmoem-ail) lda]
all22emoalmo

muad 3117/ee10.av11/2021/ml@mo. @lo3mamayos, 2021 @) 24
1197 ailetro 8
1943 =oq30 2.

2021 @O 23-00 DVT] EHO8 NGRS QllBoMNINEN SO @IS$e O
&3SIMMMY B lomERMEBRE81Ss @RAlIlERIESID DBIMI@ (@ IMIRLEN|SICmIIM].

1AIBEMNN®S 2OMOQIMB (@100,

ail. a0dl Mmo®a,
Ml 6TVEe50l.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




2021-9e1 126-20 MMUA 6323l

2021-0e1 6,08 MMIale joeilgl (6cEWEI) eodaslmadmy

0™ JlojeRleslon  ag)$lal@®Ioensde  TVLQICVEOODI@  6HO8  NAIGLRRA

Qilgoenioee ]SO @).

1994-0e1 6608 MMIMila joeildl @re:q aflensio
6RAVMI SalgpmM @I es

630}

300l

afldle,.—2020-0e1 6608 mymIailejoeilgl (6c3L@I) sodaslmadmy (2020-ee1 31) 2020
60@ 2-00 BT 6508 NAUBGNA Qll8oenitee|s;OIlomM@Imoelo;

2020 @oWQY 2400 OO 62BN  GHOS  ALOAVNIM  MIVWATVEWHS
MEIMSMODI@ (IN@I® S2BUIMABAVIAT ald:0o MoMNIM MIVATVE@AS B0} GG
8HH06NBJAIOMMIMSS &B0) enil@d ml@aveI@ @AIMGlq fleeym@lmyo
aIOQRIBNMMIMYo Bl @IMoeIo;

@M@ adlmmadles! alnImoeud mleimloyemm@lmoall 2020-ee! 6608
mladle joeilgl (8c3L®I) adalmamday (2020-ee1 63) 2020 ©TVaTgoenId 26-00 @)
8508 NAIGERHA Qilgoenioeq|syOmIloaM@Imoelo;

2020-9e1 6008 mmlmile oeilgl (030 6ERWMI) BddSImmmY (2020-ae1 70) 2020
&M igoeni@ 26-00 MM 608 VAIBENA Qll8oeninee]s;OBIIOM @IMIeI}0;

@IV asodulmmavlee! QIS QIMOBUD afle BRRINMIHE8I0S
vladldommalmodll  2020-ee1 608  myladlejoeilgl (@M eREL®)
edlmmmy  (2020-ee1  77) 2020 maloenid@  19-00 Tl@@ 6808 VABENA
aflgoenioeq|sioml@lo}malmoelo;

2020 awlovoeni@ 31-00 DO@IDI@  C218M EHOS MLoUNIM MIWAMVEYHS
memsmomlee 2021 MGl 8-00 B @OoEla] 2021 23mMaIdl 22-00 @I

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




@OQIMVIMla]  BHO8  ALOMROIM MIVAMVEWIOS  ALEAASMGILITMIP (IO
6308l BNV UBHBE) ald»®o QLoMNIM MlamEeS 630) QOB
HH06NBJAI0M@IMSS &30} enil@d W OhIgVEO) o @Gl fleeam@lmo
aIOROBNM@IMIe BFIOIBIOM @IMoeo;

E@V®  adlmmavidgleel  aljaimasud  mleimldommalmol  2021-6e!
85,08 MMlale oeilgl (6eEL@I) sodalmmmy (2021-6e1 13) 2021 6anENIQIG] 9-00 G
808 NAIBERNA Qllgoenioeq|syOmIloaM @IMoelo;

2021-0e1 6608 mMIMSlajoellgl (0enzd0 6cEVMI) eddlmmmY (2021-ee1 34) 2021
8anENRAAG] 12-00 BRG] 608 VABENA Qil8oenINe |SiemIIoyM @ImoeLo;

2021 ¢a@ 24-00 @™ @YOoEla] 2021 2336m3 10-00 D@ @PAMVIMa] BHOS
MoMNOM MIWAMVEIHS MVEMASMEOLIOND (EINIO® BIBWINMBAVIGUBHE  ald 0o
MOMNOM MIVATVEWIES B0} BYE:] BBINBAUANMBIM88 83©} enilad Mlwamecw]cd
@AMl fleemM @M aldqRIBIM@IMe B¥l@odloM @IMoelo;

EINV®® 6303almnadausgleel alnImoe:ud Mleimldomammalnol 2021-6e1 6508
Il joeilgl (e sodalmmay (2021-ee1 88) 2021 =}e6el 1-00 DV ¢H08
»0AIBEMA allgoenioeqsiomlalogmalmoeo;

2021 230681 22-00 DG @YOoElL] 2021 @RYWAY 13-00 G| @RAITVIM,] 608
MLOMNOM MIWAMVEOS MVEMASMEILIOD  (EINI®® &BBAWIMMBAVIGHUBHE) aldh®o
(MeMOIM MATVEINS B0} @YGQ HBIMBIAUM@IM88 630} nilad Mlwaavelod
@AMl fleeimM @M aldqIBIM@IMe B¥l@o@IoM @IMoelo;

ROMOMIHNG  GOeMeLISMAOS  213-00  @OMGgYIB0  (2)-00  euemwo  (ag))
9aleUEML(1d000 (EITIO® 630dAUlmadaVlay 2021 ©mMeiQoenid 2-00 MG (@Ioenielo
0@V OORM @IMILI0;

@Vo®  sdlmmmileel QIS MleINIAO®IDIClENM  aldHo
©6QaHAEERUD OEMBIBOAM WIMILI0;

BHO8 VoMM  MIWAMVE  AVEMASMOTILILPOOD@IMILRe  @IMW  TVD]O
MNSalSIOWSIEHOMED  @YAUUDIRIGIIM  QVaNAIOEERUD  Mlelnileppem=ary  eH0s
DNQIRERABHS BeNIOELINODIBlBHMIMOLI}0;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




D6 |0Ud, @P@IMI@, RIOMOMIHAY BOEMLISM@OS 213-00 @PMYGgJ30 (1)-00
QUEMW (1000 M@ |3 GRUIE:0068303 QllMleIUTla] 6HO8 NAIBEIRE ISP O
&3Sl MY il8oenInee |SIoYmIIMi—

1. 2096 |0)  (@I000B0Re—(1) ®»  aodaslmadavdla)  2021-ee1  6H0OS
mladle joeilgl  (6eRU®I) B30BAUIMMMY ag)m) Gald alO@Do.

(2) 2 sa3lmMMIl@, ag AlWEMIT AKIMLO H2IDD (@ IB00RIFIEIB:,—

(ag)) 4-00 Q] 2020 6a@ 4-00 GV (@IONIEIODIG QUM @I
B0} DB |CSEME™MY0;

(enil) 5-00 QIBa] (1)-00 Qalidhlojio, 6-00 Qldlaflo 2020 HAVaTGoenId 30-00
@D (@I0eNILIODI@ QM @I B:03®E|BSENZM]0;

(i) 5-00 Qidge] (2)-00 alQidla] 2020 Malenid@ 19-00 GO
(@106NIEIODI@ UM MOV B0} |BSEMEMYo;

() 3-00 Qldlallo, 7 DIO@ 12 QAIOOIBS Qo }d8e 2021 ®anENIQI]
12-00 @@ (@ 106NILIOMIEE AUM@IWV] &0} |ESENEOIMIE.

2. 1994-0e1 20-0. @Y @ITBLNENBND] EENDI 6)21QY6a |ESENEGIEN).—DD
godaullmmmy dlelaileildleaym  @oeio@ 1994-0e1 6o:08 mMIMilejoeilgl  @reglay
(1994-0€1 20) (D@IMBUDHO (EIWOM @YY ag)IMIEM @ l0INAUTlEON|SIE:) 3 MO 12
AUOOBS Al pBSlD  AIONeSIDIdlenm  6EENDIBWES  allcwnoal
(@1oen1elimeNz0@clesiam @aen).

3. 2-00 Ql)o lo0d BEBENTI.—(EIWIM GBYBG:FIOEI 2-00 QUd:}e {l@d,—

(i) 17-00 @IEMLOMIMIGUDAHo @IOY alOWIM  AIMLo  GalBBHENBZDI6N,
BROIQO):—

“(172g) “ag)oaldM@W  RITVABAU”  ag)IMI@  MUWOBI0S  Qldlo|lon
Ol=tloem@d 6e0@af W@ORAIMGISIT 0Elgud e 1mIgIssmie Goegsslad 2019-66!
6508 MMIaVlajoellgl e@sls Mldomoem 21633 (13000 OHIIA 621VGISBS@OWI]
SHOJMS)MDMo  AV[@o  MVIBHal@o  M@BMMIOHNG AU ERIBEHIDS]
BEGUDTV@OEOEM Qldsla], MBeRDB66)0]3 (@100 ag)oaldMT 6)2IDMTNAIW, BOOD®)}

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




MoN@BaIOSL], TuNdalMo, @YALSNSHY, afer2ilmlad, eniladasley) alleeauma,
M3 ]B09QITNVA BRI SVEM oJdMA ag)MBGONIBIMN).”.

(i) (22)-00 QUEMLOTBIMIGUDaHO I |ODIAN  EUAMWo  B2lBBLEENBZMIE),
BRIV —

“(2229)) “@06OM  @RAIBSTVIWIODIBS  OBSISBRUWD” )M  oBS
dlQalad 0D 2WOMB3®e M3} Ml Aeo  aldldlme]siomlaligissm)e
MM aloyowo  dlQdlad  @joan® mldmile  alndoldemmsseie ag)l
Qllmle@on!eMOMIEI6Ia|SENMID AITVURNBRS)0, SDOIMIA 21MOUIRAIQCIME @00
vidmle  alneldeneomos;  @slo®le  of)2  QlMle@INWEMOTI@q |STRDOD
8a00QR@3, 830BanemMed, BUAAIQOI, BOUBW a@Bes BanJo, HAVAIMIAI ag) MU0, LOIAMI
aloewodlgdlad  @joan dldmle almioldepeomosy  @pslomp  enil
allle@onneMO®I@ee 3O QflGHREPIV OBSISEB8, DOIMIO 2IOOUORIQOI@D
000  midmle  almidldegpmssope Al allmle@onnemomlaeq |3
A®al0Ql}o GRUDAVEMaNAIDAMI®  @YAIUDEERUIBNEAME] @RYSIGUD  UEMAS]lBe}IM
Od3lsenRslo, MO a1mEWAIQAl@d  @joan@ MIdmile  aladaldepemmos@slo®yo
agal  QllMle@ONUNEMOMI@eQ|SIMO®  6&:3lSeaRs0,  VDRIEIEPOD®0  @aldS
MLOWDDIRJPEODH@ROD MO 21E}OEUIAIQOIT G0 MIdmilm allmidldsmmss =11
Qllle@ONUNeMO® @6 |SEIMOD @SSRS DUBSL|SIAM].”.

(iii) (43)-00 QUEMLOBIMBUDHO MODCOVIAN  AUETWO  B2lBBHSENBGIEN),
@OOIYO):—

“(43ag)) “UIo ALIGH{AI(@0” 2)IMIT HIODM @BV IBSTVIW IS
ad3lseanses MIGmIeMOmIEMI al}mdmIdaoemomlemo caleklanss ead:slsomleang
oJoMB, ©OAVY o203 2 GOVADo (EIINIEIOMIERSS BYG:GIOLIW0 21SEBRSlORID)0
QIO UBH 0 W@RMAVIo  M@BH6|SISIS8  e@o®sslelo  MIBE3UOTIMI0
@IBD§d0 al0aISI8s MOMBEMLEBRUDON 0 MA6ERUBEN0,  2l1SEERUBEN0
MIBE3UOEBRUBIBN  BPMAVIOMINEMAN  OHSISOMIHAE  OSAAVUOMIe  aF)oaldM@US
89LINMIVI®I0 Mo@ISMAIDI] M@BIAM AVoMVIGH (@0 )M BEOMIBIAM}.”.

4. 6-00 QIB)a {1603 EEREWM.—(EIWIM BYG:GIORI 6-00 Qld:la] (3)-00 Dalidsle fl@d,—

(ag)) (ag)) UEMDLODI@,—

(i) (1)-00 DalaemMLOMIBL] “DO}IOMIWINI” ag)M QAUDBSIM  aldh®o
“ED 0 IOMIWEI®IL” af)aMN QIIHE) Cal@CHHENIMIEN);

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(i) (i)-00 ®alaieMLOMIE “GOMWBalOMINM” ag)M QOSSN aldh®o
“@OMalO®IO6NE” o)M QBN  “DOIOMIINP” oMM QA0S  ald0o
“ED 0 IOMIE®II” af)aN QOO0 BalBBHENBMIGN);

(endl) (enil) auemMw oM@, —

() @00 SalalemMLODIBOL “GPMBaICMIWINI” oM  QAUIBSIM)  aldhOo
“@MBalOMIEDILP” og)M QIOHE) GalBCHNENBMIGN);

(ii) (ii)-00 2aleemuEBIOE! “MIGIODIM” ag)aM AUIBSIM ald0o “My0”

a)0N QBN “BOMalOMIWINP” o)A QUGS aldh®o “GRABalOMIWEr®I}” ag)aMn
QOGN0 BalBBHHENZMIGNM).

5. 126-00 Q180 {1603 6EENGI.—(@I1WOM BYE:Qleel 126-00 Qld:q{l@d,—

(1) dlenilegss  agaiun @O (1)-00 Qalide 0] @ResGlesENzM0

@(1000 @PBSAlg (1)-00 Dalaidleflorl glaim dlenimwmall@d, “coaileel 7 memleso
OOQUIEIMDo 5 MEMIBN0” af)aN QUOIBNGHUBHNo BRHNEEBUBHEN0 ald0o “coaileel 7
26MIH6o HHAUBIBIM D0 6 MEMIBH” )M QAUIBEGHBlo BOANEENRBo GalBCLSEMIMIGN) ;

(2) @EISI00 BRHAIS (1)-00 DalQldlaflMie @EMINY Blslenss glaiom
MlenIMLM@ B0 BUDaHO @IS ODIAM Dalldhla] Bal@BHEENIIE), BRI OTY:—

“2) Moo  2aladefldd dlunidly  @EIS00M88  TLVAORIGI,
@PAIVIMEOD 80} 26MIBeRA 130ag) Qe fl@d alemaosslaldlesm ailcowsmglenss
@OBBUBHS) QIS H2IQIM@IMo@] allmleouilesssmmos).”.

6. 130-00 QIdlo{lN} GUDaHo o AW Qldrla] GaIBLO@.—(IWIM BOB:Fleel 130ag)
QB 130enil QIB:)a 0@ 0 MOBeAIESENZ®]0, @100 al)NOBealg 130enil Qldsa iy
208010 @690 |0 Qldsla| GalBEHHEMZ@MIE), BRIV DY :—

“130 ag). 2fle1 alleGoweErslenss EVBIGUBH6) Mald@ QIF] GRS .21 GIM8S

(@Ie® 10IN0.—(1) 130-00 QlB:Ja{lOR! ARINNGSIHS TVINIMIND B BoUoQIBIOD,

®I6%o oM aileomsglenss mm@IBIWE:A08), MIARDIB66)e SO  ([@18d0o,
®ald@d ISl 6I0S) O2IQRMTIMS8S  EPAITLEAENIIDIBILEM @M, BPGIWOY:—

(ag)) MVI0@ S BOIWO NIDWla) aGBO®I0IBI0;

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(enil)  &®POMPMI@B EHDIBLHIM BODOVIS)o;

oflvodle:oemo:— M Aldleflom evIvdIOIcRIEe I, —

(i) “Voo@ald BDINO” ag)MI@ 2021- HLI CHOS MVJo(@AlH GOIWNEIRUD
@ &:qgleag (2021-ee1 4) 2-00 AUda] (ag)) UEMLOBIE MIBQY aila) (@1800MBB}0 (IMIDR®
@O  3-00  Qde] (@IS0  TVBHHNIB, BOOD®} AVADo,  QllEeOaIMo
021Q@II8SORAOD AVIEEAIBEOIUW0 o) BBLORIBIIM;

(i) “@o0glnlad @R@IdleaMm @YU’ agIMIT MVIEAlD: BOINODIOG
QlPalMo MSVIMD@IMIDI], RIOMIVBLNIAINNG BYEVIW BISIENIEHHA  AOMOLIDo,
BOOOIVAWo,  alj0esiallecnm  MmdQPIMIBEZUOEBRUD  (@IB:000  MVEMLOIMOYTY
S|20F M@ ERDHDIBEaMM @BUB oM B@ODIB)IM].

(2) (1)-00 DalQIB[IT AUGDAISSIW (@ 1BHIOMSBS aBo@BIIeNo Qllcomssnslee
80} MLMDIGIWSHNM @ald@ ISl GQS 62l  @POLIEIT  Galdglou)

BERaUMI@ 126-00 Qldla] (2)-00 Dl @ QAUGONILSHID TLAOD), GMAlS GRS
6).21QOAM @AI6T).

&0la]:—(2)-00  QalQidlaflorl aQIMOG0d 2020 Maloenid  19-00 Gl
(@I06NIEIODI@ UM @O B0} |ESENZMIE.”.

7. 387-00 Qld o {1008 6EEVMI.—(EIWIM BBB:FIeEI 387-00 Qld: o {I@d,—

(i) (1)-00 201U l@ “@)SITd” ag)I QIOOSIA) BUdaHo “GROLIEBIT BJ0610TD
@alBSTLIWIM@IB OB SISEBRUB” af)MN QUOBNGUD B2IBCHENI®IEM;

(i) (ag)) QUMLODI@ “COEUINLINIW 63D} BVCIGHDI0” )N QUIBNHUDH)]
ald®0o  “GOAUIMPIMBS  BOCIGHUEWI  GROLIBIT  BI6MOSLID  MEMISS
@BAIGRHEDI” o) QUIDN}GHUD B2lBCHENBZMIG);

(iii) (enil) QUEMLODI@ “COEIINILINIW GO} BPGAIGHDY” af)M QUL UDH)]
ald®0o  “GOAUIMPIMBS  BNCIGHUEWI  GROLIBIT  BI6MEOSLID  MEMDISS
@OCAIMHEDI” a)(MN QAUIBNIDUD BalQCHENBMI6).

8. 38900 qidqfload 6EROGI—EIWOM  Gogleel  389-00  Qlde{ldd
“MTBBHIMONAUNODP0”  af)0N QAUIBNGUDBS] GUdaHO “@H0EIM @ald:STUIWITIQISS
OD3ISMUBOLOSDIBS” ag)aM AUIBNDHUD B2lBBHEENE®IEN).

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




9. 390-00 aidleflom  eREOML—@EIWIM GB&Fleel 390-00 Qe fldd “ma]o
GlaIuomImdo” o) AUIBNGHUWH] ald0o  “al®lMe®]  Glairvomlmdo”  ag)am
QIO UD BalBCHSENBZMIGM).

10. 391-00 Qlds o {003 BEREWBI.—(a WM @R GIeE! 391-00 Qs {l@d,—

() ‘M@ [ElATOBING0” o) QAVBNGUWBHN]  ald0o  “al@Imernl
BlaInomIM@0” o) QAUIBNGHUD G2IBCHHENIDMI6NY;

(i)  glatomadleninwm@ “0ja]@ GlaITVESNII” o) QAUIBNGUBHE) ald:0o
“almlmer@] GlaInEeILIo” o) QAIIBEGUD GalBCHHENZDIEN).

11. 392 o) oM  o@®®  QAdla]  6alB8O@B.—@lWIM  Gd:glee
392-00 QUd}a lN}BUDHO @IBS O Qldle] B2lGBHHENB®IET), BRGOWOY.—

“3920g). OGO @RalBSTVIWIOIBS  Od3lsearud  mldmileamm @lmss
@OGalSH.—(1) B0  @DalSHSTVIWO@IBS B0} ODSISo MG H6BHEI
a)NBICMNEN®EO  alQPIMW  9BRUDIBNAN  a@BO®OVIBle  @R@EIGHI0MSS
OD3ISOMIONg Odsls MAIMOBIM88  @PoUTI@:0OMIMIDIe  alemIMsOmMGIMSS
@PMQINBOMIMIDo BO} BRGaIBH MIBENIB66SIARMM (EISHIOMSS 2N000TN eSS
NV @o MVOGHSA (DA @P(IBHOOMBS COUBBLo Mall®o HAVESOIBE) MNTDEHEMMIET).

(2) agygjodllaileno a3deRRO® (1)-00 Qalidla] (IS00MSS B0} GOGAIG:H
eIClee Mm@ eIV@:30l @oeaT (EIaOBl FlaITVERUBEN B0 MIdERDBe60]SO0RMM
(@12000)88 aNIOOBIE RO} HEBQUTVIG:H e I(@0 @OGaIRH:T) MTBCHNZGIEN).

3 (2)-00 Dalldhla]  (@ISHO0MBN 630) & |QITVIH 0 |(@o
LIClBOIM@ICM@ @ IB:00MBS 5P |QITVIG:H (@0, GBEINHI0MSS OB:SISOmIeN]
OBSISMOIMOBIM88  @UTIG00RMIW0  aleMIMSOMMTIMIB8  @OMAUOBRIDYo
B 0}MEISIAM @61, ”.

12. 515-00 Ql)q {1003 6EBELT.—(EIWIM BRBFIeOel 515-00 Qldefleog (2)-00
9al0lB)a{lNIEUDaHO ISP |OIAM Dalldla [JbUB G2IBBBENBMILT), BPMIVDY:—

“B) 80} af)oaldM@AU  SHRITVABIV]  HHJOTD  @Vald:S  TVIWIOWISS
adslsengles MIdmmoemOmIEMd  aMBMIGIIEMOMIEMI  AVIo  TVIGHSa (@0
M@ BTN TVoNIDI@, 0D BRYG:lOLIGWO AP@INBBISITB DEM0L66)0|3 21568BEl6RIGO
QIAUMOSE80  MIAIMIAVIMo  M@MSIDVIPB8  a@o@®sleo  MIBE3UERI G OLA®o
@MIOMIERS8  o@eO®B e  MaOmIee!l  QIIMOBE3D  Lloceila )06
@RI aBOMESIER0 AUTIOMB:UB MO2AUE)0 BYEM @O IGHIOMBS HBSISODI)

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




MU[@o  AVIGH (@0 M@BHIW@  og)am  oklauolot)  @PWIGOO],  B06mMiMaldto,
@1B00m88  0layoled) @PUWIBIABlES  ag)oaldM@W  eeeIrMIilo®  @erml
QUGHOBIG  SHIOWICD &30} BILIWSQNGLISE MVoMLNIMDD) (IR S2IGM@IAY
afleles  «@B6a]SOMOARM@MYe  @REIGIOMBS  HHLITVMAVIBE  af)@IOO  B006mMo
@26M1ee @ MISIMNY M@ EBI@@IM BUdaHo @D 1B00MSBS e&LITLAdTII@I@ Mlmmyo (4)-00
9alQldo{l@ QUM 21D (@18:00MBS ail® HDSIBEHOARM@MI6M).

(4) VOMVIGHI@ODIT AUBMAOSSIDVIPYBS AUQITUOBUB Lloeila|ied06Ns
M3 96336 @I 0 MAMIB2£6)}B3EWO B2IVD BB SISEBRSINS TVoNTIDIM@D, @100
V|@o TVIGH (@0 NABID HBSISOMIONR OSATLOMY0 aF)oaldM@W HSEITLMMVlE6)0,
80}  &I06Mo  &I6MILO@  eMOSINY M@BBIDTIMEUDaHO,  @OEISHIOMSS
9SAMNMYo VLIV M@ A0klS] @M lelo  966MmHBITd  @RO)
10106 @IMNEUDaHAI BREIGIOMB8 @BIGSIEMIMP, MO 21OOEUIRIQE QIOO
Tidmle  almMi@demnmss  eo@slseaanuwdas ©0ms  elddo Ol  Qflmalye O
21030wWoaIgd Ao MIdmile AlnSGldenM8s 6@:SlseRUdEs MIET eldHo 0ot aflmao
MM 218 aleo Mldmilm allidldemmss 6dSlseBUdes) @O EldHo ol
aflmalie alle sD®sOB601M@I6).

(5) o=dlgyoloy) @PUWIEGIO] ag)S}Om MSalSle:E80 «j06Si0ile] DOmOGAIINEI
aLIsaM)Elenan @Sl BVEIGI0NSS  OOMOQUGUBBHNI  MSalSIGUBCHD
o) @00 MVBESIAB@D, (3)-00 alid:la ]} lB00m88 DOMOQT LIGl] BNV M@ Moo
GlaIaveRUdee @ @ {lad Muadqe{lesdammmos.”.

13. 0goseene alonesene.—(1)  2021-e0e1 6508 MMMl joeildl (6e3M)
a03ulmadmy (2021-ee! 88) @M@ 0308l dleaymm;.

(2) @O&ROM 030688IVIOMIBOMOM D0, (EINIO® SIBWIMMAY (18000
6RRNDI ©.21QY6e3 (EIWIM BYBGIMBIFIT 6 21VMHEDI 6).2IVDODOV] B0 SIM B
@O® oBOOBIEe  HOVBAD  f)SIOMEDI  a)S)OM®IV]  HO}ME|S)MEDI B
aRBOO®®AIE0  MSalsled, MY SBAWIMMM (@100 GRENDI ©alYee]s  (EIWIM
@GBSI 6.21DD@ICWI 0f)SIOMDICWI BO}ME|CSENEEIEN).

@Olad MOMAE 610D,
DUCGPD.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




10

GOVERNMENT OF KERALA

Law (Legislation-C) Department

NOTIFICATION
No. 3117/Leg. C1/2021/Law. Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 24th August, 2021

8th Chingam, 1197
2nd Bhadra, 1943.

In pursuance of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of
Kerala is pleased to authorise the publication in the Gazette of the following translation in English

language of the Kerala Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (126 of 2021).

By order of the Governor,

V. HARI NAIR,
Law Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




11

[Translation in English of “2021-ee1 6&08 oyMlmilajoeildl  (6eELG)
6308WlmMadMY” published under the authority of the Governor.]

ORDINANCE No. 126 OF 2021

THE KERALA MUNICIPALITY (AMENDMENT)
ORDINANCE, 2021

Promulgated by the Governor of Kerala in the Seventy-second Year of the Republic of India.

AN
ORDINANCE

further to amend the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994.

Preamble.—WHEREAS, the Kerala Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (31 of 2020)
was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 2nd day of May, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature
could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala during
its session which convened on the 24th day of August, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance, the Kerala
Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (63 of 2020) was promulgated by the Governor of
Kerala on the 26th day of September, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, the Kerala Municipality (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (70 of
2020) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 26th day of September, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinance with certain
amendments the Kerala Municipality (Third Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (77 of 2020) was
promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 19th day of November, 2020;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinances by an Act of the State Legislature

could not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala during

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




12

its session which convened on the 31st day of December, 2020 and during its session which

commenced on the 8th day of January, 2021 and ended on the 22nd day of January, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinances, the Kerala
Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance,2021 (13 of 2021) was promulgated by the Governor of
Kerala on the 9th day of February, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, the Kerala Municipality (Second Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (34 of
2021) was promulgated by the Governor of Kerala on the 12th day of February, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature could
not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala, during its
session which commenced on the 24th day of May, 2021 and ended on the 10th day of June,
2021;

AND WHEREAS, in order to keep alive the provisions of the said Ordinances, the Kerala
Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021 (88 of 2021) was promulgated by the Governor of
Kerala on the 1st day of July, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, a Bill to replace the said Ordinance by an Act of the State Legislature could
not be introduced in, and passed by, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala, during its
session which commenced on the 22nd day of July, 2021 and ended on the 13th day of August,
2021;

AND WHEREAS, under sub-clause (a) of clause (2) of Article 213 of the Constitution of India,

said Ordinance will cease to operate on the 2nd day of September, 2021;

AND WHEREAS, difficulties will arise if the provisions of the said Ordinance are not kept

alive;

AND WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of the State of Kerala is not in session and the
Governor of Kerala is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take

immediate action;

Now, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article 213 of the

Constitution of India, the Governor of Kerala is pleased to promulgate the following Ordinance:—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




13

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Ordinance may be called the Kerala

Municipality ( Amendment) Ordinance, 2021.
(2) Save as otherwise provided in this Ordinance,—
(a) section 4 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 4th day of May, 2020;

(b) sub-section (1) of section 5 and section 6 shall be deemed to have come into

force on the 30th day of September, 2020;

(c) sub-section (2) of section 5 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 19th

day of November, 2020;

(d) section 3 and sections 7 to 12 shall be deemed to have come into force on the

12th day of February, 2021.

2. Act 20 of 1994 to be temporarily amended.—During the period of operation of this
Ordinance, the Kerala Municipality Act, 1994 (20 of 1994) (hereinafter referred to as the principal

Act) shall have effect subject to the amendments specified in sections 3 to 12.
3. Amendment of section 2.—In section 2 of the principal Act,—
(1) after clause (17), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(17A) “empanelled Licensee” means any institution, architect, engineer, building
designer, supervisor or town planner, as the case may be, registered under the Regional Joint
Director of Urban Affairs or deemed to be registered under the Kerala Municipality Building
Rules, 2019, and empanelled in such manner as may be prescribed by the Local Self Government

Department for the purpose of issuing self-certification.”;
(i1) after clause (22), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(22A) “low risk buildings” include residential buildings under Group Al
occupancy, with built-up area of less than three hundred square meters and height less than seven
meters and limited to two storeys, hostel, orphanage, dormetry, old age home, seminary under
Group A2 occupancy having built-up area less than two hundred square meters, educational

buildings under Group B occupancy having built-up area less than two hundred square meters,

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




14

Group D occupancy buildings where persons congregate for religious and patriotic purposes
having built-up area less than two hundred square meters, Group F occupancy buildings having
built-up area less than one hundred square meters, Group G1 occupancy buildings without any

nuisance and not dangerous and having built-up area less than one hundred square meters.”;
(ii1) after clause (43) the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(43A) “self-certification” means self-certification issued jointly by the owner of
the building and the empanelled licensee to the effect that, the building plan and site plan for the
construction or reconstruction of the low risk buildings, are in accordance with the provisions
of the Act and rules, for the time being in force, and any lawful direction issued, any stipulation

as to the standard of specifications, laws, rules and directions.”.
4. Amendment of section 6.—In the principal Act, in sub-section (3) of section 6,—
(a) inclause (a),—

(1) in sub-clause (i), for the words “twenty six”, the words “twenty five” shall be

subtituted;

(i1) in sub-clause (ii), for the words “twenty six”, the words “twenty five” and for

the words “fifty three”, the words “fifty two” shall be substituted;
(b) in clause (b),—

(1) 1in sub-clause (i), for the words “fifty six”, the words “fifty five” shall be
substituted;

(i1) in sub-clause (ii), for the words “fifty six”, the words “fifty five” and for the

words “one hundred and one”, the words “one hundred ” shall be substituted.
5. Amendment of section 126.—In section 126 of the principal Act,—

(1) the existing provision shall be numbered as sub-section (1) thereof, and in the
proviso to sub-section (1) as so numbered, for the figures, word and letters “7 a.m. and 5 p.m.” the

figures, word and letters “7 a.m. and 6 p.m.” shall be substituted,

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




15

(2) after sub-section (1) as so numbered, and the proviso thereunder, the following sub-

section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2) The last one hour of the time fixed under sub-section (1) shall be used for

voting by such classes of persons as specified under section 130 A.”.

6. Insertion of new section after section 130.—In the principal Act, section 130A shall be
renumbered as section 130B, and before section 130B as so renumbered, the following section

shall be inserted, namely:—

“130 A. Special provision for postal ballot to certain classes of persons.—(1) Without
prejudice to the generality of the provisions contained in section 130, the following classes of
voters shall have the opportunity to give their vote by postal ballot in such manner, as may be

prescribed, namely:—
(a) any person who is affected by epidemic disease;
(b) any person in quarantine;
Explanation.—For the purpose of this section,—

(1) “epidemic disease” means epidemic disease as defined under clause (a) of section
2 of the Kerala Epidemic Diseases Act, 2021 (4 of 2021) and notified by the Government under

section 3 of the said Act from, time to time;

(i1) “person in quarantine” means a person who is in quarantine as per the guidelines
issued by the Ministry of Health and Family Welfare, Government of India, from time to time, to

prevent the spread of epidemic diseases.

(2) A voter as specified in any of the classes under sub-section (1) may give his vote
by postal ballot or may give his vote directly at the polling station, in such manner as may be

prescribed, at the time fixed under sub-section (2) of section 126.

Note:—The provisions of sub-section (2) shall be deemed to have come into force on the

19th day of November, 2020.”.

7. Amendment of section 387.—In section 387 of the principal Act,—

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




16

(1) in sub-section (1), after the word “hut”, the words “or low risk buildings” shall be

inserted;

(i1) in clause (a), for the words “an application in writing”, the words “an application

in writing or through online” shall be substituted;

(ii1) in clause (b), for the words “an application in writing”, the words “an application

in writing or through online” shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of section 389.—In section 389 of the principal Act, after the words

“re-construction of a building”, the words “including low risk buildings” shall be inserted.

9. Amendment of section 390.—In section 390 of the principal Act, for the words “within
thirty days”, the words “within fifteen days” shall be substituted.

10. Amendment of section 391.—In section 391 of the principal Act,—
(1) for the words “thirty days”, the words “fifteen days” shall be substituted;

(i1) in the proviso, for the words “thirty days”, the words “fifteen days” shall be
substituted.

11. Insertion of new section 3924.—After section 392 of the principal Act, the following

section shall be inserted, namely:—

“392A. Application for the construction of low risk buildings.—(1) Any person who
intends to construct or reconstruct a low risk building, shall file an application to the Secretary,
for approval of the building site and for permission to execute the work of such building along

with a self-certification, in such form and along with such documents, as may be prescribed.

(2) On receipt of an application under sub-section (1), complete in all respect, the
Secretary shall, within five working days, issue an Acknowledgement Certificate, in such form, as

may be prescribed.

(3) On receipt of an Acknowledgement Certificate under sub-section (2) such
Acknowledgement Certificate shall be deemed to be approval of the building site and permission

to execute the work of such building.”.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




17

12. Amendment of section 515.—After sub-section (2) of section 515 of the principal Act,

the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) In the case of issue of self-certification by the empanelled licensee for the
construction or reconstruction of low risk buildings, if the Registering Authority finds that the
empanelled licensee issued the self-certification to such building in violation of the provisions of
this Act or the rules made thereunder or any lawful directions issued, or any Act or rule for the
time being in force, or concealing any fact, such registering authority may debar the empanelled
licensee from practising in the State for a period of not less than five years, and after issuing a
show cause notice to such licensee, a fine as provided in sub-section (4) may be realised from such

licensee.

(4) Where a building is constructed or reconstructed in violation of the provisions
specified in the self-certification, an amount of rupees two lakh each for building with built-up
area upto one hundred square meters, four lakh rupees each for building with built-up area upto
two hundred square meters, six lakhs rupees each for building with built-up area upto three
hundred square meters, shall be realised as fine from such owner and empanelled licensee who
have issued such self-certification after giving a show cause notice and considering the reply, if

any, furnished by such owner or licensee.

(5) A person who is aggrieved by the actions taken or the orders issued by the
Registering Authority, may file an appeal before the Government against such order or action

within thirty days from the date of receipt of the order under sub-section (3).”.

13. Repeal and saving—(1) The Kerala Municipality (Amendment) Ordinance, 2021
(88 0f 2021) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or deemed to have been done or any action
taken or deemed to have been taken under the principal Act as amended by the said Ordinance

shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the principal Act as amended by this Ordinance.

ARIF MOHAMMED KHAN,
GOVERNOR.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2021 gze-

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/

Digitally signed by Salim A
Date:2021.08.25 07:44:19 +05:30




		2021-08-25T19:44:19+0530
	Salim A




